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5 Matters Arising 

 
 

1. It was agreed that Ray Flynn, 
Associate Director (Place) 
would represent University of 
Wolverhampton and Janis 
would represent the Youth 
Council going forward.  
 

2. That the Terms of Reference 
would be refreshed to reflect 
these changes and brought 
before Towns Fund Board for 
noting. 

 

Darowen Jones, 
Towns Fund 

Programme Manager 
(Managing Director, 

Kinver Solutions) 

Next meeting 

Ray Flynn and Janis are now 
regular attendees to the meeting 
and confirmed on the refreshed 
Terms of Reference. 
 
 
 
 
The Refreshed Terms of 
Reference in line with item 1 is on 
the meeting agenda for the 
January meeting. 
 

8 
Levelling Up Bid 
- Tranche 1 

 
That the proposal to incorporate 
an accessible quiet study space 
for all learners be explored as part 
of the City Learning Quarter 
planning. 

Richard Lawrence, 
Director of 
Regeneration (CWC) 

Next meeting 

 
Richard Lawrence, Director of 
Regeneration (CWC) is to attend a 
future meeting with the college to 
discuss this proposal further and 
understand the brief for the 
requested space. 
 


